M.S.A.D. # 11 Fuel Bids

May 22, 2008
No. 2 Fuel Propane Super Unleaded Diesel
C.N. Brown Co. 4.379 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dead River
Irving Oil 4272 -4.352 3.348 No Bid No Bid
Dennis K. Burke 4.375 No Bid

Sprague Energy

Union Qil Co

Wadleigh's

Wehber 01l Co.

Downeast Energy

4.399

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

2.509

No Bid

4.629

J& S Oil

M. W. Sewell

+ $.40 over rack

Maine Power Options

+$.135 over rack

+$.135 overrack




Facility

Laura E. Richards
Riverview

TC Hamlin

Pittston 1

Pittston 2

Helen Thompson
Supt's Office
Transportation
Storage Bldg GAHS

GRMS
(GAHS

Transportation

Total

512772008

Fuel Bid Comparison

# 2 Fuel Consumption for M.S.A.D. #11

Total Gallons Used

12,284
8,332
7,544.10
4,895.00
1,582.70
9,206.60
2,874.60

24,503
54,513

125,735.00

‘Webber
2.2365

27,472.72
18,634.97
16,872.38
10,947.67

3,539.71
20,590.56

6,429.04

Dennis K, Burke
2.11
51,701.33

115,022.43

# 2 Fuel
2008 /09 Budget
‘Webber 2008/09 vs. Projected
4.299 Budgeted
52,808.06 34,500.00 {18,308.06)
35,820.13 25,000.00 (10,820.13)
32,432.09 19,000.00 (13,432.09)
21,043.61 15,000.00 (12,847.63)
6,804.03
39,579.17 25,000.00 (14,579.17)
12,357.91 6,500.00 (5,857.91)
‘Webber
4.299
105,338.40 65,000.00 (40,338.40)
234,351.39 115,000.00 (119,351.39)

(235,534.77)

Diesel Fuel Consumption for M.S.A.D, #11

55,000.00

2,37

Diesel
Dennis K, Burke Dennis K. Burke  2008/09 2008 /09 Budget
4,595 Budgeted vs. Projected
252,725.00 120,000.00 (132,725.00)

130,350.00

Total Fuel Shortfall (368,259.77)



